
Welcome to 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com. These 
Terms and Conditions (“Terms”) are a binding 
contract between 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com, its 
affiliates and you, the user. By accessing or 
using the website or the services made 
available, you agree to be bound by and 
comply with these Terms. If you do not agree 
to all of these Terms, please do not use 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com 

user agreements, Submissions, use of 
information, no warranty, prohibited use, and 
user conduct: 

Terms & Conditions for PandaMaster.com 

1. Introduction 

The following terms and conditions (the 
“Terms”) govern your use of the 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com website 
(the “Site”). By accessing and using the Site 
you agree to be bound by the Terms and all 
policies, rules, and regulations that are 
incorporated herein by reference, including 
the Privacy Policy, which govern our 
relationship with you in relation to the Site. 

2. ELIGIBILITY: 

This website, 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com (the 
“Website”) is intended solely for users who 



are 21 or older. All users under the age of 21 
are strictly prohibited from using the Website 
and playing any of the games available. Users 
must also abide by all laws that are applicable 
in their place of residence. 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com reserves 
the right to verify age at any time for any 
reason, and we may suspend an account if we 
suspect underage use or any other breach of 
this Agreement. 

3. GAMES: 

3.1 sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com 
features a wide variety of games, such as: 
Skilled Fish Games, Slots, Roulette, Blackjack, 
Baccarat, Poker, and Keno. 

3.2 You are solely responsible for ensuring 
that your financial transactions are in 
compliance with all applicable laws. 

4. PASSWORD 
RESPONSIBILITY: 

4.1 You are solely responsible for maintaining 
the confidentiality of your account and 
password. sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com 
will not be liable for any direct or indirect 
damages that may arise from your failure to 
comply with this security obligation. You 
accept full responsibility for any and all 
activities that occur on your account. 



4.2 If for any reason you suspect that an 
unauthorized third-party may have gained 
access to, or is using your account 
information, you must contact 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com 
immediately. 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com reserves 
the right to terminate your account with or 
without warning if 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com suspects 
that it is being used in any way that is not in 
line with the website’s terms and conditions. 

5. Payment for Virtual 
Credits 

User understands that purchase of virtual 
credits on the Site may involve a “real money” 
transaction. Credits purchased through the 
Site are non-refundable. User agrees to 
provide accurate and complete payment 
information, including name and address, to 
the third-party payment processor. User 
agrees that any fraudulent use of the Site or 
any other illegal activity occurring through 
use of the Site will be subject to criminal 
investigation and/or civil legal action. 

6. Online Code of 
Conduct 

User agrees to act in accordance with the 
ethical standards of the gaming community. 
User agrees to refrain from any illegal activity 



or conduct through use of the Site, or 
otherwise. User agrees to respect the Site, its 
users, and any staff personnel. User agrees to 
not stalk, harass, threaten, or otherwise cause 
harm to any other user of the Site. 

7. User Agreement 

7.1 User agrees to create a personal profile 
using accurate and complete information, 
including identity and age. 
 
7.2 User agrees to maintain their profile in an 
accurate and complete manner, updating it 
whenever necessary. 
 
7.3 User agrees not to use the Site or its 
services for any commercial or other purpose, 
nor to solicit any funds or goods from any 
other user of the Site. 
 
7.4 You may not use 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com for any 
illegal activities or for any purpose that is 
prohibited by these Terms. 
 
7.5 You agree to comply with all applicable 
laws, regulations and ordinances of your 
country, state or jurisdiction as these may be 
applicable to your use of 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com 
 
7.6 You are solely responsible for any actions 
you take while using 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com, including, 
but not limited to, the payment of any goods 
or services. 



8. Use of Information 

User grants 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com a non-
exclusive, irrevocable, unlimited license to 
use communications and other information 
submitted by User to the Site. 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com reserves 
the right to use such communications and 
information without compensating the user in 
any. 

9. Limited License 

Visitors are allowed to view, use and 
download content from 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com only for 
personal, non-commercial use, provided that 
any content accessed, used or downloaded is 
not posted, modified, transmitted or 
distributed, in any way. 
Sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com reserves 
all rights and may revoke any license at any 
time. 

10. Indemnity 

The User agrees to indemnify, defend, and 
hold sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com, its 
owners, officers, directors, employees and 
agents, harmless from and against all 
liabilities, losses, damages and expenses, 
including attorney’s fees and court costs, 
resulting from any breach of these Terms and 
Conditions. 



11. Access 

Subject to the following Conditions, 
sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com grants the 
User a non-exclusive, revocable license to use 
this Website, including all features and 
functions associated with it. By accessing this 
Website, Users agree to be bound to all the 
Conditions and terms of use, including all 
material available on this Website. 

12. Disclaimer of 
Warranties 

sjarcadeentertainmentcenter.com does not 
warrant or guarantee the accuracy or 
completeness of any information, materials 
or content on the website. It is the user’s 
responsibility to ensure that any material 
viewed or used from the Website is free from 
infection, viruses, worms, or other malicious 
or destructive code. 
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